
Summer Term 2024
DAILY WEEKLY TERMLY

ENGLISH MATHS RE OTHER SUBJECTS

Read for at least 5 minutes OUT
LOUD every day - you can read to
anyone: mum, dad, baby sister,

cuddly toy, down the phone to Gran
or even to yourself in the mirror!
Record your daily reading in your

Home School Diary. You need to hit
your Accelerated Reader Points

Target each Half Term. Try to read
from a wide range (fiction,

non-fiction, poetry).

Play at least 5 minutes of TTRS every
day, and aim to earn the TTRS Trophy

every week!
Complete at least 1 soundcheck every
day, aiming for 25/25 - how much can
you improve in the summer term?

Create a paper prayer chain. Each
week, add on a new link that says

thank you, sorry, or asks for help with
something that is on your mind. Is
there a specific person, event, or

place you would like to pray for? Use
your Home Reading Diary for prayer

ideas!

Science
Create a sculpture using whatever
materials you have at home to
demonstrate the structure and
functions of the human heart.

Write a diary entry from the point of
view of someone in a country that is
being invaded/taken over by the

British Empire. It must be at least 200
words, or 1 page if handwritten.

Spend 10 minutes each week on
Maths Flex to keep working along

your pathway.

Design a poster to show what the
Beatitudes mean in your own words,

and how they can be shown in
actions.

Geography

Design and conduct a survey to find
out how eco-friendly and sustainable
your home is. What are you already

doing at home to help the
environment? What could you be

doing better?

Read and perform a poem that is at
least 8 lines long. Think carefully

about expression and pace when you
perform it to the class at the end of

the Spring Term!

Design a Maths quiz or board game
that we can have a go at on the last
day of term. It must link to decimals

or negative numbers!

Write a speech or letter explaining
the importance of stewardship and

encouraging others to be stewards of
God’s creation.

Art

Create a piece of artwork,
representing whatever subject you
like, using what you have learned

about pointilism.

Home Learning can be shared on Google Classroom throughout the term, or brought in for a Show and Tell afternoon just before the Summer Holidays.


